Sign Bid Request for Leavenworth County
2026 Bid Tabulation

Vulcan Inc dba

Lightle Enterprises Frankfort,

Custom Products Jackson,

National Sign Co

Foley, AL OH Ms Kansas Correctional Industries Ottawa, KS
Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
Our Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
High Intensity Prismatic reflective Faces P/S quantity Bid Bid Bid Bid
W1-1R 30"x30" Turn Right Black/Yellow 8 8 S 13.06 | S 104.48 | S 13.63 | S 109.04 8 S 1517 ]S 121.36 8 S 27.84|S 222.72 8 S 17.75| S 142.00
W1-2R 30"x30" Curve right Black/Yellow 5 S 13.06 | $ 65.30 [ S 13.63 | S 68.15 S 15.17 | S 75.85 S 27.84|S 139.20 S 17.75| $ 88.75
W1-2L 30"x30" Curve Left Black/Yellow 5 5 S 13.06 | $ 65.30 [ S 13.63 | S 68.15 S 15.17 | $ 75.85 5 S 27.84|S 139.20 5 S 17.75| $ 88.75
W1-3L 30"x30" Re-Turn Left Black/Yellow 10 10 S 13.06 | $ 130.60 [ S 13.63 | S 136.30 10 S 13.08 | S 130.80 10 S 27.84|S 278.40 10 S 17.75| S 177.50
W1-5L 30"x30" Windy Road Left Black/Yellow S 13.06 | $ 7836 |S 1363 (S 81.78 6 S 15.17 | S 91.02 S 27.84|S 167.04 S 17.75| S 106.50
W1-6 Single Arrow 24"x 48" black/yellow S 1672 |$ 66.88 [ S 17.44 | S 69.76 5 S 1941 |S 97.05 S 3564 |S 142.56 S 2275| S 91.00
W1-7 Double Arrow 24"x 48" black/yellow S 1672 | S 66.88 [ S 17.44 | S 69.76 5 S 19.41|S 97.05 S 3564 |S 142.56 S 2275| S 91.00
W1-8 Chevron 18"x 24" black/yellow 10 10 S 6.27|S 62.70 [ S 654 |S 65.40 10 S 6.46|S 64.60 10 S 1337 |S 133.70 10 S 850]|S 85.00
W2-1 Cross Road 30"x 30" black/yellow 4 4 S 13.06 | $ 5224 (S 1363 | S 54.52 5 S 15.17 | S 75.85 4 S 27.84|S 111.36 4 S 17.75| $ 71.00
W8-12 No Center Line 36"x 36" black/orange 10 10 S 1881 (S 188.10 [ S 19.62 | $ 196.20 10 S 1869 | S 186.90 10 S 5257 ]S 525.70 10 S 2555 S 255.50
W8-3 Pavement Ends 30"x 30" black/yellow 16 16 S 13.06 | $ 208.96 | S 1363 (S 218.08 16 S 13.08 | S 209.28 16 S 27.84|S 445.44 16 S 17.75| S 284.00
W14-2 30"x 30 " No Outlet Black/Yellow 25 25 S 13.06 | $ 32650 | S 1363 (S 340.75 25 S 13.08 | S 327.00 25 S 27.84|S 696.00 25 S 17.75| S 443.75
W18-6 30"x 30 " Minimum Maintenance- Black/Yellow 25 25 S 13.06 | $ 32650 | S 1363 (S 340.75 25 S 2289 |S 572.25 25 S 27.84|S 696.00 25 S 17.75| S 443.75
Travel at your own risk
OM-3L 12"x 36" Black/Yellow 50 50 S 6.27|S 31350 |S 654 (S 327.00 50 S 6.46|S 323.00 50 S 1337 |S 668.50 50 S 815 S 407.50
OM-3R 12"x 36" Black/Yellow 50 50 S 6.27|8$ 31350 |S 654 (S 327.00 50 S 6.46|S 323.00 50 S 1337 |S 668.50 50 S 815 S 407.50
18"x 24" Black and White 15 15 S 6.27|8$ 94.05|S 654 (S 98.10 15 S 26.85|S 402.75 15 S 1337 |S 200.55 15 S 815 S 122.25
This County is zoned, permits requiored for all buildingg
R1-1 30" Stop White/Red 50 50 S 13.06 | $ 653.00 |S 1363 (S 681.50 50 S 1271|S 635.50 50 S 27.84|S$ 1,392.00 50 S 16.50 | S 825.00
R2-1 Speed Limit 24"x 30" Black/White 40 40 S 1045 | S 418.00 | $ 10.90 | S 436.00 40 S 10.70 | $ 428.00 40 S 22.28|S 891.20 40 S 1455 S 582.00
No Numbers on sign face
R12-1 Weight Limit 24"x 30" Black/White 40 40 S 1045 | S 418.00 | $ 10.90 | S 436.00 40 S 11.75| S 470.00 40 S 22.28|S 891.20 40 S 1455 S 582.00
M1-6 Route Marker blue/yellow 24" 20 20 S 1996 |$ 399.20|S 952 (S 190.40 20 S 1697 | S 339.40 20 S 17.82|S 356.40 20 S 16.60 | S 332.00
M5-1L Turn Left Blue/Yellow 15"x 21" 10 10 S 458|S 4580 |S 522 (S 52.20 10 S 675]|S 67.50 10 S 975]|S 97.50 10 S 6.00]S 60.00
M5-1R Turn Right Blue/Yellow 15"x 21" 10 10 S 458|S 4580 |S 522(S 52.20 10 S 675]|S 67.50 10 S 975]|S 97.50 10 S 6.00]S 60.00
Metal 0.08 Aluminum
24"x 48" 4 holes 8 8 S 4061 |S 324.88 [ S 49.20 | S 393.60 8 S 41.90|S 335.20 8 S 6479 |S 518.32 8 S 38.00|S 304.00
21"x 15" 2 holes 10 10 S 1187 (S 118.70 | S 13.47 (S 134.70 10 S 1093 |S 109.30 10 S 17.72|S 177.20 10 S 9.00]|S 90.00
9"x 24" no holes 100 100 S 833]|S$ 833.00 (S 9.23|S 923.00 100 S 7.28|S 728.00 100 $ 12.15|S 1,215.00 100 S 620]8$ 620.00
9"x 30" no holes 20 20 S 10.51 (S 21020 [$ 1154 | S 230.80 20 S 9.71|5S 194.20 20 S 15.18|S 303.60 20 S 770]|S$ 154.00
12"x 6" 2 holes 70 70 S 286|S 20020 [$ 3.10| S 217.00 70 S 263]|S 184.10 70 S 4.05]|S 283.50 70 S 210]|$ 147.00
30" Stop 2 holes 50 50 S 30.52|S$ 1,526.00 S 38.00|$ 1,900.00 50 S 2829 |S 1,414.50 50 S 50.62 |S 2,531.00 50 $ 27.00 | $ 1,350.00
18"x 24" 2 holes 30 30 S 1515 (S 45450 [ § 18.45 | S 553.50 30 S 13.71|S 411.30 30 S 2430|S 729.00 30 S 1230 S 369.00
24"x 30" 2 holes 60 60 S 2571 |S$ 154260 (S 30.75|$ 1,845.00 60 S 22.65|S 1,359.00 60 S 4049 |S 2,429.40 60 S 20.60 [ $ 1,236.00
30"x 30" 4 holes Punched for diamond and Square 100 100 S 3214 |S$ 321400 (S 3844 |S 3,844.00 100 S 2829|S 2,829.00 100 S 50.62 | S 5,062.00 100 $ 27.00 | $ 2,700.00
18"x 18" 4 Holes Punched for diamond and Square 40 40 S 11.48|S 45920 | S 13.84|S 553.60 40 S 1050 | S 420.00 40 S 1822S 728.80 40 S 930|S 372.00
24" Route Marker M1-6 2 holes 20 20 S 1895]S 379.00 | $ 25.10 (S 502.00 20 S 2325]|5S 465.00 20 S 3239|5S 647.80 20 S 34.00 | S 680.00
12"x 36" 2 holes 50 50 S 1589 |S 79450 | S 1845 (S 922.50 50 S 1371 |5S 685.50 50 S 2430|S 1,215.00 50 S 1230 (S 615.00
Rubber Stacker Stand Dsb100 14 NO BID S - S - S 13835|S$ 1,936.90 14 S 13339 |S$S 1,867.46 14 NO BID NO BID 14 S 9550 S 1,337.00




36"x36" Roll up Signs Super bright reflective Orange
One Lane Road S 9881|S$ 592.86 | $ 103.91 | S 623.46 S 96.50 | S 579.00 6 NO BID NO BID S 7550 S 453.00
Fresh Oil S 9881|S$ 592.86 | $ 103.91 | S 623.46 S 96.50 | S 579.00 6 NO BID NO BID S 7550 S 453.00
Flagger Symble S 9881|S$ 592.86 | $ 103.91 | S 623.46 S 96.50 | S 579.00 6 NO BID NO BID S 7550 S 453.00
Road Work Ahead 16 16 S 9881 |$ 1,580.96|S$ 103.91|S 1,662.56 16 S 96.50 | S 1,544.00 16 NO BID NO BID 16 S 7550 S 1,208.00
Tree Work Ahead 6 6 S 98381(S 592.86 | $ 103.91 | S 623.46 6 S 96.50 | S 579.00 6 NO BID NO BID 6 S 7550 (S 453.00
Galvinized Round Post 12' 2 3/8" 48 48 S 4460 (S 2,140.80|S 4291 (S 2,059.68 48 S 35.42|S 1,700.16 48 NO BID NO BID 48 S 30.00 [ $ 1,440.00
Green U Channel Post 10' 2 Ib/ft 50 50 S 2835(|S 1,41750(|S 27.10(S 1,355.00 50 S 21.41|S$ 1,070.50 50 NO BID NO BID 50 S 25.00 | $ 1,250.00
Green U Channel Post 7' 1.12 Ib/ft 50 50 S 1181 (S 590.50 | $ 12.81|S 640.50 100 S 11.49 (S 1,149.00 50 NO BID NO BID 50 S 1290 | $ 645.00
Green U Channel Post 12' 2 Ib/ft 50 50 S 34.03|S 1,701.50|S 3250 (S 1,625.00 50 S 25.69|S 1,284.50 50 NO BID NO BID 50 S 30.00 [ $ 1,500.00
12"x50 yds Green Electrocut 4 ROLL | 4 ROLL S 157.50 | $ 630.00 | $ 156.25 | S 625.00 4ROLL [$ 191.22 (S 764.88 4ROLL |$ 265.00 (S 1,060.00 4 roll $ 210.00 | S 840.00
12"x50 yds Black Electrocut 2 ROLL | 2 ROLL S 157.50 | S 315.00 | $ 156.25 | S 312.50 2ROLL | $ 191.22 | S 382.44 2 ROLL NO BID NO BID 4 ROLL $ 210.00 | $ 840.00
12"x100 yds Clear Transfer Tape 2 ROLL | 2 ROLL S 109.76 | $ 219.52 | $ 120.00 | $ 240.00 | 2ROLL |$ 115.12 S 230.24 | 2ROLL |$ 161.00 | S 322.00| 2ROLL | $ 13260 (S 265.20
TPMS5 ECF
9"x50 yds White High Intensity prizmatic 4 ROLL | 4 ROLL S 14963 | S 598.52 | § 154.13 | S 616.52 | 4 ROLL $ 191.25 | $ 765.00 | 4 ROLL NO BID NO BID 4 ROLL $ 170.10 | $ 680.40
Solar Barricade Flashers Amber 10 10 S 6258 (S 625.80 | S 5250 S 525.00 10 S 38.23|S 382.30 10 NO BID NO BID 10 S 5450 (S 545.00
Replacement Pannels Barricade Orange/White
8ft x1"x8" Plastic High Intensity Double Face | 24 24 S 5868 |S 1,40832|S 47.50|S 1,140.00 24 S 7858 |S$ 1,885.92 24 NO BID NO BID 24 S 37.00|S 888.00
Temporary Pavement Tape #3034
Yellow 4"x50 yds Construction grade | 10 ROLL| 10 ROLL S 9898 |S 989.80 | $ 66.00 | S 660.00 | 10ROLL | S 68.22 (S 682.20 | 10 ROLL NO BID NO BID 10ROLL | S 6585 S 658.50
18" Stop/Slow High Intensity Paddles | 10 10 S 4248 |S 42480 | S 49.80 | S 498.00 10 S 3476 |S 347.60 10 NO BID NO BID 10 S 5550 (S 555.00
with 6ft Handle
R11-2 Road Closed Black/White 48"x30" | 10 10 S 75.00 S 750.00 [$ 83.50 | S 835.00 10 S 87.80|S 878.00 10 NO BID NO BID 10 S 89.95 (S 899.50
4 holes Sign Complete with aluminum
Orange 36" Double Reflective Collars 4" and 6" 10lb Base{ 12 12 S 4496 |S 539.52 | S 30.38 (S 364.56 12 S 3049 |S 365.88 12 NO BID NO BID 12 21.75 S 261.00
Wide Body Cone

100 100 S 040]S 40.00|$S 0.10](S 10.00 100 S 018]S$ 18.00 100 NO BID NO BID 1carton/100 | S 30.00 | $ 30.00
5/16" Set screws Stainless Steel SS-516

$ 30,844.41 $ 34,038.80 $ 31,950.69 $ 26,325.85 $ 30,038.35
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